Bid Tab - Chemical Bid 2025-2026

Key

Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper SlaciesContracteiconmerial Vendor;\i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
$15.41
Ao1 Take Down Fresh & Gl 110 $39.05 - CU-1430- | $29.60 - Take Down - Bio Conquer Liq $39.98 Hillyard & $29.60 &
Clean @ HIL0046806 Enzymatic Deod 4/1gal 920341 MIDLAB INC Royal Paper $15.41
Mango
$15.97 Clavt
o2 Scenturion (Odor ol 10 $69.94 - CU1730- Desert Rain $107.49 o e $69.94 &
Counteractant) i cax1 Concentrated 24569977BETCO roonet $15.97
Deodorizer CORP oyal Faper
Nu-Llfe &
Comet/Alax- i $34.97/case A $39.68 $32.80 '
A0S | Restroom Cleaner |210z.-Case of 12 | Powder-No 180 $39.55-CPC1az7sCT | 346 - Cream Clean 12| b e 40780T $22.56 - Ajax Comet Powder w/ bleach | 860261 COLGATE- | Fyramid | $34.97 &
s quarts - HILO0I0604 CPC14278CT-12 School $22.56
q 12/case 12/210z PALMOLIVE-IP Products

Concentrated Dispenser Chemicals and unit

$31.17 CP':Fy)te"r” $34.25,
; : $34.25 - Spartan - d Spartan SSE Carpet $92.47 . : $121.26,
Az | CarpetPresspray case %0 SP3137-12 el Prespray & Spotter | BET4024700Essendant | o WIYE | $31.17 &
4/1gal & Staples $92.47
$89.79 $29.03 baren $28.71,
a3 Neutraier case 85 $28.71 - Spartan - | g144 12.HIL0081925 | NL Neutral Clean Away i Dzasalta] Hilyard, Nu- | $144.12,
SP3029-04 4-1 Shineline Floor Prep $89.79 &
-1gal/case ; LIfe, Royal
Neutralizer Cond P $29.03
aper
$29.03 Clayt
nts | Shinctine Floor preg | 4-1 300N 10 $28.71 - Spartan - SP3029-Spartan $57.78 P;"ér"g $28.71 &
° Bottles SP3029-04 Shineline Floor Prep 919503MIDLAB INC R pl P $29.03
Neutralizer Cond oyal Faper
$52.98 Clayton
$64.90 - Spartan - $106.22 $64.90 &
A-15 Recoat Prep Case 20 SP4330.04 $103.54-HI1L0083425 Spartap C!ean on the Go BET1884 700Essendant Paper & $52.98
Shineline Cleaner Royal Paper
Clayton
$53.10 - Spartan $69.88 $106.22 Pager’ $$15936 13%
A-17 Spray Clean HD Case 100 Ao ° $196.32-HI1L0182025 Spartan Clean on the Go ; Hillyard, o o
SP4740-CG Shineline Peroxy BET1884700Essendant Royal Paper $§19(.)868282z
& Staples '
Clayton
_ _ $114.99 $32.67 $33.25,
A9 Super Shine-All | 1 Gal/Case of 4 78 $33'82§30f2’"5f” $107.66-HIL0080825 NL Wax-sealer Spartan Damp Mop $”204g?7301 H!Tlapec;‘, & | $10766&
: 4-1gallcase Floor Cinr ryar $32.67
Royal Paper
Clayton $50.34
$97.59 $49.25 Paper, i
$50.34 - Spartan - $33.49 . $132.40,
A-24 Top Clean Case 150 SP4830-CG $132.40-HIL0081025 NL Mop Away SpartaAn Clean on the 919529MIDLAB INC Hillyard, $97.59, $49.25
4-1gallcase Go, Tirbase Cleaner Royal Paper
& $33.49
& Staples
Clayton
$55.55
) $55.55 - Spartan - $44.66 Paper, ’
A28 Windo-Clean Cose 10 SP4835-CG O T2 919530MIDLABINC | Hilyards. | ¥10.925

Staples
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Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper StaplestentizciElconpeical Vendor:i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
. BioRenewatles® |, 75 $55.55 - Spartan - . $5§'360| he G $44.66 Royal Paper | $55.36 &
Glass Cleaner 18 ortles SP4835-CG partan 1an on e 0 | 919530MIDLABINC | & Staples $44.66
Bio Reneable Glass Cinr
A2 Non-Acid Restroom c 320 $89.99 - Spartan - $75.84-HIL0081925 S$83-27CI th $49.47 Hillyard & $75.84 &
Disinfectant/Cleaner ase SP4716-CG Hins (22 aG”O ,\‘fig g” ©  |24477087BETCO CORP |  Staples $49.47
$37.54 %':gg’r" $50.34,
. $50.34 - Spartan - g Spartan Clean on the $62.45 : ¥ $110.52,
A3 Robusto Case 300 SP4830-CG S22 Go, Xcelente Neutral [24477091BETCO CORP | H'"ny:‘,'d' $37.54 &
M/P Cleaner oya. maper $62.45
& Staples .
Biohazard
Clayton
$53.87 Paper, Nu-
Deodorant-vomit . . p $3.14 each - Full Cases $7.15 LIfe, Pyramid ($45.70, $53.87,
A36 B Each/Canister 210 $45.70-BIG D BD150 | $6.96-HIL5029 - 12 oz. Big D BGD166 Only - 12 Cans in a case $6.87 RL3080 154050Essendant School $314 & $6.87
12/case
Products &
Royal Paper
, $3.22 each - Tolco# | $4.69 MDI- Pyramid
A37 Deodorant vomit Each/Bag 200 $54.45--BIG D BD166 260099 - 25 Bags in a 19-0001-Magic Dr S School $3.22 & $4.69
absorb : 9 i 9 ; y 154050Essendant Products & - :
case sorben Royal Paper
C3 Supplies
Govon | saes
) $33.65 - Spartan - $74.57 . : $162.15,
A37 Nutra-Rinse Case 110 SPA736.CG $162.15-HIL0071522 $29.03 SP3029 24560744BETCO coRrp | _ Hillyard, $29.03 8
Royal Paper $74.57
& Staples :
Clayton
) $47.40 - Spartan - $156.60 $47.40 &
A-38 Shineline Floor Prep 4-2L Bottles 10 SP4857-CG $29.03 SP3029 2773501BETCO CORP Paper & $29.03
Royal Paper
Clayton
Suprox: C3 (6- 1/2 $75.30 - Spartan - $42.49 Paper, $75.30, &89.29
A39 gal/case) Case 30 SP4820-CG $89.29-HIL0070422 24441473BETCO CORP | Hillyard & & $42.49
Staples

Carpet Care

A-42

Extraction Shampoo

5 Gal

$47.80 - Spartan -
SP3096-05

$98.03 HD Extraction -
HIL0094106 - 4
Gals/Case

$56.44 RL4055

$67.62
919536MIDLAB INC

Clayton
Paper &
Royal Paper

$47.80 &
$56.44
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Key Accepted Bid
Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper StaplestentizciElconpeical Vendor:i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
$50.69 $51.35 ROYALAB Clayton
. Defoamer Silicone $72.99 Paper, Nu- |$51.80, $50.69
Ads Defoamer Case/ 1 Gal 145 $51.80 CU3600-C4X1 NL Fia;n Al\;vay #P556 Emulsion Defoaming | 2773490BETCO CORP |Life & Royal & $51.35
Rl agent Paper
Enzyme
Clayton
Cleaner-Enzyme (1 $54.50 N
A48 | Gallon Bottle. 4 per Case ENZO-BAC 30 $51.80-CU5000-C4X1 NL Digestaway #P552 $69.34 SP7659 gg%%ff MIELABING Pi?f:" g‘u $51&8§é§59‘g50
[¢ _ .
el 4-1gal Staples
Clayton
Paper,
Liquid Enzyme Il (1 $54.50 $39.57 ROYALAB . Ny, |$44.55, $58.83,
49 | Gallon ottle. 4 per case 100 $44‘55($4l§551140' $58.83 - HILO047006 | NL Digestaway #P552 Bactivate Enzyme 22%351 MIDLAB ING rlilvard, Nu- 1564 50, $39 57
Case) 4-1gal Fortified Digester Deod e, moya &$39.98
Paper &
Staples
Floor Care
$36.18 Clayton
asy | HEMISDUSEMOD | g e Hi002130305 15 $39. 80 paoatan - | §81.43-HIL0021306 Spartan Dust Mop Cloth Hilord & $39.80, 361.43
Treatment Royal Paper
Clayton $
71.55,
HR 2000 - Hillyard (1 $71.55 - Spartan- | $108.70 - Restorer - $48.63 " $85.64 Paper, $108.70,
A4 Gallon Bottle. 4 per Case 50 SP4330-04 HIL0053906 Reshine Floor Finish 913191MIDLAB INC Hillyard, $48.63 &
Case) Maintainer Restorer Royal Paper $85.64
& Staples .
Dust Mop Tr $68.77 Hillyard &
ASS ust Mop Treatment | o art/Case of 12 100 $133.54-HIL0101604 NL Dustmop Away varc
> 4-1gal/case Nu-Life
Floor Care, Gym
$40.02 )
Pre-Game, (1 Gallon . Hillyard & $67.08 &
A7 Bottle. 4 per case) Case Hil0045206 63 $67.08-HIL0045206 H‘Z‘f{f‘xgg dslgsfrg(';m 24560738BETCO CORP | Royal Paper $40.02
) $281.64 Hillyard & $280.20 &
60 450 Gym Finish sGal 40 $280.20 24560735BETCO CORP |  Staples $281.64
Floor Finish
Clayton
$81.99 Paper, $77.90,
: ) $77.90 - Spartan - ! i $59.30 Hillyard, Nu- | $107.94,
o8 Endeavour >l Hi40052507 U SP5455-05 SO ST | ML Wast as;h'gﬁ =02 ROYALAB Durashine |24534481BETCO CORP | Life, Royal |$81.99, $59.30
galp Paper & & $94.29

Staples
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Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper StaplestentizciElconpeical Vendor:i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
Soren | srrn
. - $115.67 - HILO053407- $74.96 $97.29 24560743 . ¥ $115.67,
AT ishine Floor Finish 5Gal Hil0053107 30 $77.90 - SP5455-05 Explorer 25% ROYALAB Mega Shine BETCO CORP Hillyard, $74.96 &
Royal Paper
$97.29
& Staples

Floor Stripper

Clayton
Paper,
$48.99 $49.75 ) $39.99, $60.49,
AT3 Power strip 5 Gal Hil0015007 800 $39'9§5' CUPS10220-| g5 49 . HIL0015007 | NL Strip Away #8185 ROYALAB Power Strip $7?3'§4ch)2“‘:5§£§,04 T‘.gyag’* NLl" $48.99, $49.75
5 gal pail Floor Finish Stripper ie, Roya & $78.84
Paper &
Staples
AT8 . s Gal 10 $157.55 - Devastator - $72.37 Hillyard & $157.55 &
€8 HIL0014707 805854MIDLAB INC Staples $72.37
Clayton
$47.95 - Chemical U - [$52.64 - HIL 0113355 $36.98 - Chase# 4112 e BB H'upapng $47.95,852.64,
A80 | Baseboard Stripper case 75 U280 g?’z';"’sz 1P case 19 - S asfe1 5 <7 | SHINELINE Wax &  |BET0992300CTEssenda L'ifya'; el |536.98, $43.29
- G ez 352 Baseboard Stripper nt e, Roya & $43.42
Paper &
Staples
Base Hit (Baseboard $47.89 - Zenex - $5.05 Clayton
A82 Stripping Ge) Gan 10 7X493930 24477130BETCO CORP |  Paper $47.89

Fogger

A-83

Sanitizing Fogger
Aerosol

Case

175

General Purpose

$79.99
NL Q Prodigious
#3040Q
Per case

$114 DE550002

Nu-Life &
Royal Paper

$79.99 & $114

$25.98 Clayton
na Bleach Gal 125 B§37-52§0—3 Sgg_—GL $30.13G-a+|<;/+<cegzzch -6 $4-6°Wash Bleac'\rl10VEL 815745ESSENDANT | Paper& | $3.29 & $4.60
P&L(AZERTY INC) | Royal Paper
Nu-Life,
B R $24.29 $15.94 Pyramid
A8 EXPO Cleaner Gal 80 $34§§3222?£” Expo $24.25 - Expo# 81800 $33.22 EXPO Clnr 364141SANFORD School $24&2§% 229‘225
gallon CORP Products & :
Staples
$3.94 - Gen - $4.17 $15.63 Clayton
88 Vinegar Gal e Select Harvest $4.22 VINEGAR  |24438939G&JHOLDING | Paper & Nu- | $3.94 & $4.17
gallon S, LLC DBA CANDY.CO Life
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Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper StaplestentizciElconpeical Vendor:i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
$46.59 .
$16.48 2611680 Nu-Life,
ago | AerosolFumiture Case Chase Chase 41.09 10 ST 18 omox- PR $41.98 $42.87 SP6120 CLAR Royal Paper | #4158, 4287
e MANUFACUTURING & Staples )
a2 IForce -1 ¢ 25 $95.77 - HIL0048706 | NL HID — $38.65 SP00B7 U Tilfgég‘s”’:l'k $95$Z3’6$59 e
- Degreaser ase U Sy : 760839MIDLAB INC Paper & :
4-1gal/case Staples $69.06
$41.97
SD-20 All Purpose | 12 Bottles/Case $44.75 - Spartan - Boardwalk All Purpose Nu-Life & $41.97 &
93 Degreaser |18 oz RTU Aerosol 12 SP6520-AE Spray BWK342ACT $32.22 RL3005 Royal Paper |  $32.22
case
Hand Sanitizer
Hillyard, Nu-
Hand Sanitizer - $76.85 Life, Royal [$84.37, $45.98
Ag5 Foaming case Affnlty $45.98 SP4610 | pr17952900Essendant | Paper & 8$76.85
Staples
90051120;
. Dispenser Prestige
Foaming Hand $76.85 Royal Paper
A P S B Symmetry | Black 3960001 Free $45.98 SP4610 | pET7950900Essendant | & Staples [240-98 & $76.85
soap
Hand Soap - Hair and Body Liquid Soap
Hillyard, Nu-
o . $48.99 $104.15 . !
Soap, Hand Liquid, $44.98 - Whisk - Life, Royal $44.98 &
A-106 200mi cart. Case/12 Boardwalk 8100 300 WIKWL10080012BL Boardwalk BWK8100 $35.82 SP4612 GOJ92121i?TEssenda Paper & $35.82
Staples
Green Cerified
$52.15 Royal Paper $35.82 &
A-108 FOEng?;;O"?nYVESh Case Symmetry 90091120 150 $35.82 SP4612 BET7812900 & Staples $52.15
A-109 Pr;;f:ﬂi‘::k Case Symmetry 99800001 40 No Bid No Bid
A-111 m?lzeézzgsg Case Symmetry 99610001 12 No Bid No Bid
Hair Hand, Body $56.23 Royal Paper $36.88 &
A-112 Uguid Case of 6x1250 Symmetry 90081120 23 $36.88 SP4602 BET7532900Essendant & Staples $56.23

Hand Soap Affinity/Dispensers




Bid Tab - Chemical Bid 2025-2026

Key
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Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper StaplestentizciElconpeical Vendor:i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
Affinity Citrus Fresh $56 23 HiIIyard &
A-113 Antimicrobial Case 650 $53.26 - HIL0040803 $48.00 SP4606 - $53.26 & $48
oaming tiond so2p 24452663BETCO CORP | Royal Paper
Affinity Foamy Soap
A-114 and Hand Soap Case 100 $61.33 - HILO041103 illyard $61.33
Dispenser

Hand Soap GOJO/Dispensers

Insecticide

$82.79 $6.41 Nu-Life &
A-116 Insecticide-aero Case Zenex 495785 21 SJN300816 $85.28 CRC266 1672099SC JOHNSON Staples $82.79 & $6.41
case & SONS P
F-6 Flying Insect 12 - 160z Cans $59.94 - Spartan - 82:79 $57.98 - Chase #4106 A Royal Paper
A7 e oo can 10 SPEO19AE SJIN300816 T o s $55.31 SP6919 | 1672099SC JOHNSON | "p'g, 18" | $55.31 96.41
case & SONS
$54.97
Insecticide-wasp- $64.94 - Spartan - Nu Life $58.98 - Chase #4108 - $74.59 Nu-Life & $54.97 &
A118 aero Case Zenex 495975 100 SP6820-AE ARABEEBopper 12-20 oz cans/case $58.04 SP6820 1668091Essendant | Royal Paper $58.04
case

Laundry
$93.79 —
Laundry Detergent $74.40 - Chemical U - Nu Life Wash-n-Clean $39.69 #50 . Royal Paper $39.69 &
A120 Powder s0lb 40 CUPS10710-p50 | $9951- HILOO765 #P601 powder Powdered Laundry Detg ggizﬁSgTéRP'c-)Es & Staples $27.15
50lb pail Up
Clayton
$414.09 $55.90
$55.90 - Spartan - $39.69 #50 Paper, ’
Ad2L | Buider Laundry seal 2 SP7001-05- AER Powdered Laundry Detg 2725252 OHINSON | piyard'a | $1US 278
Royal Paper .
Clayton
$129.99 $59.40
) _ a0 oy $137.30 $399.02 Paper, .
a2 Sour sGal 20 $59.40 = Spartan $156.39 LTS St ROYALAB Ultra Clean | 1774320J0HNSON | Hillyard Nu- | & 2839,
Laundry/Softener SP-7008-05 #P605 Liquid ; ) $129.99 &
5 gal pail Built Laundry Detg DIVERSEY Life & Royal $137.30
gal pai
Paper
Clayton $
84.55,
. S1se7r $57.21 $92.39 _Paper, $149.59,
123 Bleach Laundry 5 Gal 40 $84.55 - Spartan - $149.59 Nu-Life Clean-n-Bright ROYALAB Ox Color 1774336 JOHNSON H|_Ilyard, Nu- $139.77,
Owgen SP7015-05 #P606 Powder Safe Laundry Bleach DIVERSEY Life, Royal | g57 51 &
501Ib pail Paper & $92.39
Staples i
$318.81 Clayton
A124 HS Detergent 5 Gal 20 $64.90 - Spartan - $114.83 DVS93418761 Paper & $64.90 &
SP7003-05 ! $114.83
Essendant Hillyard
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Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper StaplestentizciElconpeical Vendor:i:cepted Vendor Accepted $
$16.99 .
) o Tt e (5T $9.57 $91.79 Hillyard, Nu-
aazs | Pemium Hand Dih Gl 5 $83.32 NulEie Egpt nRinse ROYALAB SPR Pink Liq | 24338335PROCTER & | Life & Royal [$8% 5 51999
Pot & Pan Soap GAMBLE Paper .
gallon
; $61.41 .
Detergent Dish 12 . Hillyard & $107.07 &
Az | he case 5 $107.07 ROYALAB Solid Safe
Above met Saf 1 Ga Metal Safe Solid Detg Royal Paper $61.41
) Hillyard & $202.08 &
A127 | Dish Sanitizer H-129 Case 5 $202.08 $62.48 RL6300 Royal Paper $62.48
$114.73 .
. : Hillyard, $135.91,
agg | RinsepdDihis Gal 5 $135.91 $13.23 RL6202 24498482;%??“ & | Royal Paper | $13.23&
DISTRIBUTING LLc | & Staples $114.73
Remover
$145.99
- $47.95 - Goo Gone - Clayton
Goof Off - Graffiti Pymon Vandal Mark
A-129 Remover Each WM Barr FG673 93 WMN21 3;:2 (4/240z Remover ITW07820 $7.90 CRC880 RPapIeF: & $47.95 & 7.90
panCass) 12 cans/case oyal Faper
$46.89 Clayton
Gum Remover - $41.60 - Zenex - Boardwalk Gum $37.99 - Chase CH433- $45.69 Paper & $41.60 &
A34 Aerosol Case Chase CHas3-4107 140 ZX496655 Remover BWK353ACT 4107 SZUICIAREIS 502 653324AMREP Pyramid $37.99
case School
$46.89
- ChewingGum | 12-6.5 0z Cans 2 $41.60 - Zenex - Boardwalk Gum $;§450h oG $45.69 Shayod $41.60 &
- Remover RTU Aerosol ZX496655 Remover BWK353ACT -0z Lhewing sum 653324AMREP aper $45.69
- Remover AERO Staples
$8.51 .
A137 | Gum-Go, Liquid ar 4 $267.48 6015383M Hilyard & $2gg'§? &
CORPORATION P :
Restroom Cleaner
Urinal Screens
$19.95 Clayton
) Box of 10/cotton $19.94 - Fresh - y $21.58 $19.55 Paper, Nu- |$19.94, $19.95
A Urinal screens blossom RevEswn ReN03123 15 FRS3WDCTB FRS“’;‘Q’/D%OCBL RLURINAL-Fresh 2801455Essendant Life & & $19.55
Ca=¢ Staples
Clayton
Paper, Nu-
Urinal Screen Wave $19.95 $23.58 X P ($19.94, $19.95,
142 | 30 CotonBlossom |  Boxof10 | Fresh Products 665 S mesh- $22.49 FRS3WD560CBL $18.99 Erosh- |WAVE 3D Urinal Screen | g $1955 - |Life Pyramid " Vg 1g g9 g
10/box 10/case Cotton Blossom ssendan Prozugtos & $19.55

Staples
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Item# Item Description u/m BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item Clayton Paper Hillyard Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper S eSO ] VendorBAi:cepted Vendor Accepted $
Clayton
Paper, Nu-
Urinal Screen Wave $19.95 $23.58 X -, 1$19.94, $19.95,
143 | 3DCUCMelon Boxof10 | Fresh Products 140 AL L $22.49 FRS3WD560CME S8 s~ |WAVE 3D Urinal Soreen 1955 318421 Life, Pyramid [ “g1g g &
10/box g 10/case Ocean Mist ssenaan cnoo $19.55
Products &
Staples
Nu-Life,
‘ i e Pyramid
Urinal Screen $21.55 - Big D - $21.58 $19.55 $19.95, $18.98
A-144 Cucumber melon Box of 10 Hospeco 401244 60 BD621-C9 FRS3W560CME $18.98 - Hopeco RLURINAL-Apple 318421 Essendant School & $19.55
10/case Products &
Staples
Wipes
- $33.69 Clayton
S $20.79 - Flex Wipe - .
Clorox Disinfecting CLO15949/BUN159 $70.76 - CLO35309 - Clorox wipes $6.21 Paper, $20.79, $5.99,
A-146 Wipes Each/75 Count 29 25 FWZOOst(S)ﬂS per 6/Case CLO15949/Bun15 $5.99 - Clorex# 15949 $4.14 RPH20075 616319CLOROX USA Pyramid $4.14 & $6.21
case School




